2026 MEDINA COUNTY AGGREGATE BID
Bid Opening: October 30, 2025 1:00pm
6100 Wedgewood Road, Medina, OH

ALL BIDDERS HAD
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS
AND CERTIFIED CHECKS

Osborne Medina Inc

BID TAB 795 N. Progress Drive
Medina, OH 44256
330-723-0015
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ODOT FOB PLANT | DELIVERED
LIMESTONE SPEC UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
Up to #1 & #2 and/or #4 Crushed Limestone
1,500 tons 703.01 #1&#H#2 $29.50 $34.50
703.01 #4 $29.50 $34.50
Up to #8 and/or #9 Limestone
1,500 tons 703.01 #8 $31.75 $36.75
703.01 #9 $26.91 $31.91
Up to #8 and/or #9 Washed Limestone 703.01 48 Washed $28.75 $33.75
1,500 tons
703.01 #9 Washed No Bid No Bid
Up to #57 Crushed Limestone
1,500 tons 703.01 #57 $28.40 $33.40
Up to 411 or 304 Crushed Limestone
2500 tons 703.01 #411 $25.04 $30.04
703.01 #304 $23.78 $28.78
DESCRIPTION ODOT FOB PLANT | DELIVERED
QUANTITY GRAVEL SPEC UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
Up to 411, 617, or 304 Crushed Gravel 703.01 4411 No Bid No Bid
2,000 tons
703.01 #304 No Bid No Bid
DESCRIPTION ODOT FOB PLANT | DELIVERED
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UNSPECIFIED MATERIAL TYPE SPEC UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
Up to Fine Aggregate . .
1,000 tons 703.01 No Bid No Bid
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ODOT FOB PLANT | DELIVERED
LIMESTONE DUMP ROCK SPEC UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
Upto |Dump Rock Type A Limestone 703.19 Type A No Bid Solicited $77.70
750 tons |Only delivered dump rock may be bid
Upto |Dump Rock Type B Limestone 703.19 Type B No Bid Solicited $73.20
750 tons |Only delivered dump rock may be bid;
Upto |Dump Rock Type C Limestone 703.19 Type C No Bid Solicited $57.90
750 tons |Only delivered dump rock may be bid;
Upto |Dump Rock Type D Limestone 703.19 Type D No Bid Solicited $52.73
750 tons |Only delivered dump rock may be bid;
Upto |4 X8Limestone - , 703.19 4X8 $46.23 $52.73
750 tons |Picked up 4 X 8 Limestone may be bid;
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